
 
 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
21 April 2011 
 
 
 
Freedom of Information Act 2000 – reference number RFI20110399 
 
Thank you for your request under the Freedom of Information Act (‘the Act’) of 27 March 2011 
seeking information in relation to a research project being undertaken by Bristol University and 
the University of Surrey sponsored by the UK Engineering and Physical Sciences Research Council 
investigating recent developments in energy consumption of data centre servers for the delivery of 
media. 
 
In particular, you are interested in: 
 
“- detailed accounts of the types of servers used for the operations of the BBC, in particular but not 
exclusively those serving video content 
- detailed account on the power draw of this equipment serving media content 
- figures on data volume served for BBC services.” 
 
In response: 
 
The BBC uses a mixture of BBC and third party servers. These servers are used for a wide variety 
of purposes including all of the broadcast systems used to generate, store, edit, route, play out and 
encode BBC content for national and local linear television and radio, as well as content served via 
the internet. 
 
Due to this diversity of function, the servers operated by the BBC are used across the entire 
range of the BBC’s Divisions (such as Vision, Audio & Music and Journalism) and locations. As a 
consequence, we estimate that to locate the information you have requested in relation to the 



 

 

BBC’s and third party servers would take more than two and a half days. Under section 12 of the 
Act, we are allowed to refuse to handle the request if it would exceed the appropriate limit. The 
appropriate limit has been set by the Regulations (SI 2004/3244) as being £450 (equivalent to two 
and a half days work, at an hourly rate of £25).  
 
However, we are able to provide the following information within the Regulations in relation to 
the BBC’s digital distribution: 
 
1. Detailed accounts of the types of servers used for the operations of the BBC, in 

particular but not exclusively those serving video content. 
 
For servers that the BBC operates itself, the current typical server specifications are: 
 
Standalone server: 
HP DL360 G7 2x 2.26 GHz quad core CPUs. 16 to 48GB RAM. Typical power draw 330 watts. 
HP DL380 G7 2x 2.26 GHz quad core CPUs. 16 to 48GB RAM. Typical power draw 450 watts. 
 
Blade server: 
HP BL460c G7. 2x 2.26 GHz quad core CPUs. 16 to 48GB RAM. Typical power draw 250 watts. 
 
These servers are used for a variety of services including web-serving, databases, journalism 
publication systems, infrastructure management services and metadata, but they do not stream 
media content.  
 
The BBC does not hold the information requested where the servers are operated by a third 
party (including the servers used to provide streamed media content, such as for the BBC iPlayer).  
 
 
2. Detailed account on the power draw of this equipment serving media content 
Our media streaming services are provided by specialist third party Content Distribution 
Network companies.  These companies provide services, not servers.  We do not hold 
information on the power draw of their servers. 
  
3. Figures on data volume served for BBC services  
The BBC’s online services delivered a total of 30,634 TB of traffic onto the internet in March 
2011. 
 
You may also be interested to know that the BBC has a series of targets to reduce its 
environmental impact. Information on these targets, and energy consumption is reported annually 
in our Corporate Responsibility Report, available online at: 
http://www.bbc.co.uk/outreach/reports/  
 
We hope you find this information useful. 
 
Appeal Rights 
You may request an internal review of our decision that your request exceeds the appropriate 
limit. Please contact us at the address above, explaining what you would like us to review and 
including your reference number. If you are not satisfied with the internal review, you can appeal 
to the Information Commissioner.  



 

 

The contact details are: Information Commissioner's Office, Wycliffe House, Water Lane, 
Wilmslow, Cheshire, SK9 5AF, telephone 01625 545 700 or see http://www.ico.gov.uk/  
 
Yours sincerely 
 
L. Stiller 
Legal and Business Affairs Manager 
Future Media and Technology Divisions 
 



 

 

 


